
The Society for Range Management is a 
professional organization composed of 
individuals with a common interest in the 
study, management, and rational use of 
rangelands and related ecosystems.

Who We Are

California-Pacific 
Section (Cal-Pac) of 
the Society for 
Range Management

Membership 
Experience

Regular membership is $100/year.
Student membership is $45/year.

Dues cover section and national 
membership.

Membership Dues

These include voting; committee service; 
nomination and election to offices; 
subscription to Rangelands magazine 
online and Rangeland News online; 
discounted prices for publications, 
meeting registration fees, page charges 
and certification fees.

Membership Rights & 
Privileges

• Membership meetings
• Publications & Social Media
• Range Camp
• Certified Rangeland Manager (CRM) 

Program
• Excellence in Range Management & 

Range Manager of the Year Awards

Cal-Pac Activities
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Membership Meetings
• Cal-Pac fall meetings include  

educational seminars with continuing 
education credits, social banquets to 
network with range professionals and 
professional achievement awards.

• Cal-Pac spring tours include visits to 
rangeland sites to view the latest in 
rangeland management and science.

• Rangeland Ecology and Management is 
a peer-reviewed journal published by the 
Society for Range Management (SRM).

• Rangelands is a magazine published by 
SRM and is intended for a wide-range of 
individuals.

• Rangeland News is the electronic 
newsletter of the SRM.

• Needlegrass Notes is Cal-Pac’s 
electronic newsletter.

Range Camp is a field-based educational 
camp offered for students between the 
ages of 15 and 18.  It is designed to offer 
an appreciation of the extent, importance 
and value of California’s rangelands and 
natural resources. Students interact with 
university faculty and experienced 
professionals in classroom and field 
activities. 

Range Camp website: 
http://www.rangelands.org/casrm/HTML/ 
rangecamps.html

Range Camp

Certified Rangeland 
Manager (CRM) Program

Publications

Cal-Pac assists the California Board of 
Forestry in its professional certification 
program to promote professional standards 
in all activities devoted to rangeland 
resources. A licensed CRM is required by 
state law to conduct covered professional 
range management tasks on forested 
landscapes in California, unless the work is 
performed personally by the owner of the 
land. Covered professional tasks include 
making management recommendations, 
developing conservation plans and 
management plans, monitoring, and other 
activities associated with professional 
rangeland management. Federal lands and 
rangelands void of tree cover do not 
require a license.

CRMs are required to be active members 
of the Society for Range Management.

Website & Social Media

http://casrm.rangelands.org/

https://www.facebook.com/CalPacSRM

https://twitter.com/CalPacSRM
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